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From internationally renowned yoga teacher Gurmukh comes a book on pregnancy unlike any other.
Bountiful, Beautiful, Blissful is a treasury of wisdom, information, and inspiration for pregnancy and
motherhood based on the spiritual and physical practices of Kundalini yoga, which Gurmukh has taught for
the last thirty years.

With illustrated, step-by-step instructions, she teaches time-tested techniques, meditations, and exercises that
will help you physically, mentally, and spiritually. In the timeless way that women have passed down
wisdom surrounding birth and child rearing to one another for centuries, Gurmukh weaves folk stories and
contemporary testimonials into a program designed to help you get profound results in the shortest possible
time.

The sections in this book cover each trimester of pregnancy as well as delivery and life with the baby. In her
wise, gentle, and comforting voice, Gurmukh suggests meditations, exercises, and yoga positions to respond
to the various needs of expectant and new mothers as you undergo dramatic body changes. Gurmukh also
helps you explore and, when necessary, heal your own history and unconscious attitudes about pregnancy,
birth, and parenting.

In Bountiful, Beautiful, Blissful, Gurmukh gives you all the tools you need to have a healthy and happy
pregnancy while increasing your connection to your partner and building compassion and prosperity. The
ancient practices of yoga can lead you back to your own power as a woman, capable of more than you ever
dreamed. All you need is a belief in the possibility of change and a commitment of as little as three minutes a
day. Gurmukh has helped thousands of women and their families find fulfillment through the healing
movements and meditations of Kundalini yoga---and she can help you, too!
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From reader reviews:

Colleen Thompson:

Now a day people that Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each details they get. How many people to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Studying a book can
help people out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Bountiful, Beautiful, Blissful: Experience the
Natural Power of Pregnancy and Birth with Kundalini Yoga and Meditation book since this book offers you
rich data and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt
in it as you know.

David Marx:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is in the former life are challenging be find than now is taking
seriously which one is acceptable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you obtain it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Bountiful, Beautiful, Blissful: Experience the
Natural Power of Pregnancy and Birth with Kundalini Yoga and Meditation as the daily resource
information.

Allen Reilley:

This Bountiful, Beautiful, Blissful: Experience the Natural Power of Pregnancy and Birth with Kundalini
Yoga and Meditation is great e-book for you because the content which is full of information for you who
always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal it info
accurately using great plan word or we can say no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read it hurriedly
you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but difficult
core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Bountiful, Beautiful, Blissful: Experience the
Natural Power of Pregnancy and Birth with Kundalini Yoga and Meditation in your hand like having the
world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no publication that offer you world with
ten or fifteen moment right but this book already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs.
active do you still doubt in which?

Cathy Lantz:

As a pupil exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or even
make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's heart or real
their interest. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring in addition to can't



see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we
know that on this age, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this Bountiful, Beautiful, Blissful: Experience the Natural Power of Pregnancy
and Birth with Kundalini Yoga and Meditation can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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