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? New Release THE GUN TRIAL Coming Soon ?
Infighting, carnage, and sexual favors are the rule of law at the Los Angeles law firm of Thorne & Chase!
Experience the cutthroat culture of big money law firms—firms where partners and associates must win at
all costs. They cannibalize each other battling for money, power, love, clients, and ultimately their own
survival. With blue-collar idealism and onerous student loans, first-year associate Sophia Christopoulos
covets the firm’s money and power. But her new friendships, love, and success come with the shocking price
of disillusionment, murder, and betrayal. When Sophia is hurled into a murder investigation, she is torn
between ethics and firm politics, as well as love and truth. Fighting to save her career and life, she becomes
the star witness—and then a target.
5-STAR REVIEWS OF THIS LEGAL THRILLER! “Warning – don’t start reading until you have time!”
“Author Dale E. Manolakas delivers with fully-realized characters who explode off the page. Visceral.
Sensual. Alive. Highly recommended.” “A strong, scathingly entertaining commentary on the Los Angeles
legal community. Keeps the reader guessing until the end.” “Wow! Powerful look into the law business!”
ADD TO CART
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From reader reviews:

Cynthia Bryant:

The reserve with title Lethal Lawyers: A Legal Thriller has lot of information that you can learn it. You can
get a lot of advantage after read this book. This specific book exist new understanding the information that
exist in this book represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to learn how
the improvement of the world. That book will bring you in new era of the internationalization. You can read
the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Kenny Crowther:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, small story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not trying Lethal Lawyers: A Legal
Thriller that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading behavior
all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world considerably better then how they
react to the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky person but for all
of you who wants to become success person. So , for all you who want to start reading as your good habit,
you can pick Lethal Lawyers: A Legal Thriller become your own personal starter.

Sena Meyer:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information easier to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon.
You will see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended for you is Lethal Lawyers: A Legal Thriller this guide consist a lot of the information with the
condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The
words styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some study when he makes
this book. Honestly, that is why this book suitable all of you.

John Lyons:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This e-book Lethal Lawyers: A Legal Thriller was filled concerning science. Spend your
time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has different feel when they
reading a new book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a guide. In the
modern era like now, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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