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This book demonstrates that Latin American liberation theology continues to produce substantial biblical
exegesis, absorbing theological reflection, and a sharp social critique that enhances the worldwide church. In
Jesus Goes to McDonald's, Rossi asserts that the book of Job protests against the devastating effects of
imperial Persian rule in postexilic Judah-effects seen as the stimulus for the theology of reward so severely
criticized by Job. Not since Gustavo Gutiérrez's On Job has there been such a compelling reading of the book
of Job as a literary mirror of oppressive socioeconomic and political conditions. Rossi uses Job to offer a
critique of the prosperity theology that is so dominant in parts of the church today. The second half of the
book offers a radical critique of "the McDonaldization" of society and church. Free market capitalism has
become an all-embracing worldview to the detriment of society and church. As counter-speech, Rossi
proposes a theology that favors life, a life in which solidarity with the poor is central.
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From reader reviews:

Andrew Thompson:

Book is usually written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important thing to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A reserve Jesus Goes to McDonald's:
Theology and Consumer Society will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence
if you can know about everything. But some of you think that open or reading a new book make you bored.
It isn't make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you looking for best book or acceptable
book with you?

Virginia Comer:

Here thing why this particular Jesus Goes to McDonald's: Theology and Consumer Society are different and
reliable to be yours. First of all looking at a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content than it which
is the content is as delicious as food or not. Jesus Goes to McDonald's: Theology and Consumer Society
giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no e-book
that similar with Jesus Goes to McDonald's: Theology and Consumer Society. It gives you thrill looking at
journey, its open up your own eyes about the thing that happened in the world which is perhaps can be
happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your method home by
train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of Jesus Goes to
McDonald's: Theology and Consumer Society in e-book can be your choice.

Annie Rose:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the extra time or they will
get great deal of stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not really a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer can unlimited right. Then
do you ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the
book you have read is definitely Jesus Goes to McDonald's: Theology and Consumer Society.

Clara Duke:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its deal with may doesn't work
is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside seem likes.
Maybe you answer may be Jesus Goes to McDonald's: Theology and Consumer Society why because the
great cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content
will be fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly assist you to pick up this
book.
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