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In this handbook for locating the hidden sales messages that bombard us everyday, Martin Howard explains
the new techniques that corporations are using to make subconscious approaches without your consent. It
covers the five major zones where consumers are being confronted: in the retail shopping context, at major
events and concerts, through information media, personal friendships, and your computer.

Up until recently, there was a social contract that alerted consumers to advertising messages. They were
clearly labeled, endorsements were obvious and certain areas were off-limits. That contract has been broken,
and many corporations are resorting to underhanded methods to persuade. Our shopping centers, stadiums,
telephones, friendships and editorials are all "fair game." Marketing messages have crossed into the social
sphere. We Know What You Want points out dozens of examples of how these signals are being relayed and
gives you the tools and techniques to decode these messages and make your own decisions.

Inspired by the popular book Coercion by Douglas Rushkoff, this book presents key ideas and case examples
in a practical, easy-to-follow, illustrated format. Rushkoff himself contributes the Introduction. We Know
What You Want has Rushkoff's full support; he calls it "an entertaining yet McLuhanesque 'Medium is the
Message,' filled with engaging graphics and provocative but easy-to-follow guidelines for maintaining
autonomy in a world made of marketing."
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From reader reviews:

Dennis Bryant:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, going to beach, or
picnic within the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to
something different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book might be option to fill your
free of charge time/ holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read.
If you want to test look for book, may be the reserve untitled We Know What You Want: How They Change
Your Mind can be fine book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Jeannette Coleman:

Often the book We Know What You Want: How They Change Your Mind has a lot associated with on it. So
when you read this book you can get a lot of help. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The
writer makes some research just before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can get
the point easily after reading this article book.

David Thompson:

Why? Because this We Know What You Want: How They Change Your Mind is an unordinary book that
the inside of the book waiting for you to snap this but latter it will zap you with the secret the idea inside.
Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such incredible way makes the
content within easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for
you because of not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give
you a lot of benefits than the other book include such as help improving your ability and your critical
thinking way. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I were being you I will go to the guide store
hurriedly.

Merlin Doyle:

The book untitled We Know What You Want: How They Change Your Mind contain a lot of information on
this. The writer explains the girl idea with easy method. The language is very easy to understand all the
people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was published by famous author. The
author will bring you in the new period of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can
continue reading your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a
situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site and order it. Have a nice read.
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