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Discover the fascinating history, tradition, and modern uses of the witch's mirror. From a variety of spells to
making and consecrating your own mirror, The Witch's Mirror presents valuable information for witches of
all levels. In this fun and easy-to-use guide, you'll find:

Spells to redirect bad energy, preserve anonymity, find the truth, boost abundance, bring prosperity, repel●

the evil eye, treasure your inner beauty
Meditations for soul retrieval and for scrying●

A guide to scrying symbols●

And more●
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From reader reviews:

Floyd Hatfield:

The particular book The Witch's Mirror: The Craft, Lore & Magick of the Looking Glass (The Witch's Tools
Series) has a lot of information on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was
published by the very famous author. Tom makes some research before write this book. This kind of book
very easy to read you will get the point easily after reading this book.

Maria Tate:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with close friends is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try point that really opposite from
that. One particular activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love The Witch's Mirror: The Craft,
Lore & Magick of the Looking Glass (The Witch's Tools Series), you are able to enjoy both. It is great
combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout men.
What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Helen Mota:

This The Witch's Mirror: The Craft, Lore & Magick of the Looking Glass (The Witch's Tools Series) is great
publication for you because the content which is full of information for you who all always deal with world
and also have to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it info accurately using great
coordinate word or we can claim no rambling sentences included. So if you are read this hurriedly you can
have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but hard core
information with attractive delivering sentences. Having The Witch's Mirror: The Craft, Lore & Magick of
the Looking Glass (The Witch's Tools Series) in your hand like finding the world in your arm, details in it is
not ridiculous one. We can say that no e-book that offer you world in ten or fifteen minute right but this
reserve already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt
that?

Justin Davis:

Reading a book for being new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you study a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, due to the
fact book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The The Witch's Mirror: The Craft, Lore & Magick of the Looking Glass (The Witch's
Tools Series) offer you a new experience in looking at a book.
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